

**Index of Kangaroo Island Council Agenda's
November 2014 - Current**

Meeting Date	Item No	Subject
20/11/2014	5.1	Mayor's Report
20/11/2014	6.1	Questions from the Gallery
20/11/2014	9.1	Audit Committee Meeting Minutes
20/11/2014	9.2	Boating Facilities Committee Meeting Minutes
20/11/2014	10.1	Chief Executive Officer Activities / Meetings
20/11/2014	10.2	Deputy Mayor Appointment
20/11/2014	10.3	Ordinary Council Meeting Times
20/11/2014	10.4	Council Members Allowances and Benefits Policy
20/11/2014	10.5	Committee Representation
20/11/2014	10.6	Dry Zone - 2015 KI Cup Carnival
20/11/2014	10.7	Rebuild Independence Lease
20/11/2014	10.8	Flood Recovery - Status Report
20/11/2014	10.9	Boat Launching Facility Licence
20/11/2014	10.10	Council Facility Hire - Commercial Operators (foreshore use for business)
20/11/2014	10.11	Amercian River Progress Association - Lease of Lot 1 Tangara Drive, American River
20/11/2014	11.1	Business Support Department Status Report
20/11/2014	11.2	Finance Quarterly Report - September 2014
20/11/2014	11.3	Finance Policies
20/11/2014	11.4	2013/14 Annual Financial Statements
20/11/2014	11.5	2013-14 Annual Report
20/11/2014	11.6	Adoption of 2014/15 Annual Financial Statements
20/11/2014	12.1	Asset Services & Infrastructure Status Report
20/11/2014	12.2	DPTI Credit Note
20/11/2014	12.3	Black Point Road, Willson River
20/11/2014	12.4	Mining Lease EML 5425
20/11/2014	14.1	Independent Commissioner Against Corruption - Elected Member Session
20/11/2014	14.2	Wil and Louise Escabache - National Athletics Competition Sponsorship
20/11/2014	14.3	Local Government Association of SA - Pensioner Concession on Council Rates
20/11/2014	14.4	ION GeoVentures - Proposed 2D OtwaySPAN Seismic Survey
20/11/2014	15.1	Correspondence for Information
20/11/2014	15.2	Ombudsman SA - Complaints
20/11/2014	18.1	Appointment of Independent Development Assessment Panel Members (LATE REPORT)
09/12/2014	5.1	Mayor's Report
09/12/2014	10.1	Chief Executive Officer - Activities Report
09/12/2014	10.2	Penneshaw Parking Management
09/12/2014	10.3	Awards & Grants Assessment Panel Representatives
09/12/2014	10.4	Flood Recovery - Status Report
09/12/2014	11.1	Business Support Department Status Report
09/12/2014	11.2	2014/15 Community Capital Infrastructure Grant Program - Parndana Progress Association
09/12/2014	11.3	2014/15 Community Capital Infrastructure Grant Program - Advance Kingscote Progress Association
09/12/2014	11.4	2014/15 Community Capital Infrastructure Grant Program - American River Progress Association
09/12/2014	11.5	Annual 2013/14 Budget to Actual Performance Review

09/12/2014	12.1	Asset Services Status Report
09/12/2014	12.2	Capital Works Program Review
09/12/2014	12.3	Pipeline Indenture Approval
09/12/2014	12.4	DRAFT Mobile Food Vendor Policy - Release for Public Consultation
09/12/2014	14.1	Council Sponsorship and STEDS water program 2014/15
09/12/2014	14.2	Local Government Association of SA - Pensioner Concessions
09/12/2014	15.1	Correspondence for Information - Various
09/12/2014	17.1	RSL Support
09/12/2014	18.1	Commercial Lease
20/01/2015	5.1	Mayor's Report
20/01/2015	6.1	Alan Henderson - Section 105 Fire Notices
20/01/2015	9.1	Community Centres Committee - 18 December 2014
20/01/2015	9.2	Boating Facilities Committee - 18 December 2014
20/01/2015	10.1	Chief Executive Officer Activities / Meetings
20/01/2015	10.2	Southern & Hills LGA Charter Amendment
20/01/2015	11.1	Business Support Department Status Report
20/01/2015	11.2	Quarterly Finance Status Report - December 2014
20/01/2015	11.3	Fees and Charges Review
20/01/2015	11.4	Public Consultation: Budget Reporting and Amendment Policy
20/01/2015	11.5	Public Consultation: Funding Policy
20/01/2015	11.6	Council Delegation of Authority to the Chief Executive Officer
20/01/2015	12.1	Asset Services Status Report
20/01/2015	12.2	Development Services Status
20/01/2015	12.4	Regional Health Plan
20/01/2015	12.5	Cordes Reserve Naming
20/01/2015	12.6	KI Motor Club Road Closure
20/01/2015	12.7	Pipeline Indenture Approval
20/01/2015	12.8	DAP Terms of Reference re-adoption - LATE REPORT
20/01/2015	13.1	Nil
20/01/2015	14.1	Call for Nominations for LGA President, Board Members & Deputy Board Members
20/01/2015	14.2	Ombudsman SA - Personal email accounts and Council Members
20/01/2015	15.1	Correspondence for Information - Various
20/01/2015	15.2	Correspondence for Information - LATE REPORT
20/01/2015	17.1	Urgent Business
20/01/2015	18.1	Nominations sought for the Development Assessment Commission - Nominations to Outside Bodies.
20/01/2015	18.2	Outstanding Rates Payment Request
20/01/2015	18.3	Code of Conduct 2015-01
10/02/2015	5.1	Mayor's Report
10/02/2015	10.1	Chief Executive Officer Activities / Meetings
10/02/2015	10.2	Pipeline Indenture Approval
10/02/2015	11.1	Business Support Status Report
10/02/2015	11.2	2015/16 Budget Timetable
10/02/2015	11.3	Public Consultation: Kangaroo Island Council Strategic Management Plan 2014-2018
10/02/2015	11.5	Public Consultation: Council Facility Hire Commercial Operators - Foreshore Use for Business Purposes
10/02/2015	11.6	Public Consultation: Emu Bay Boat Ramp - Land Sale to Co-Finance Upgrade
10/02/2015	11.7	Star Club Field Officer Program

10/02/2015	11.8	2014/15 Community Capital Infrastructure Grant Program - Parndana Soldier Settlement Museum
10/02/2015	12.1	Asset Services & Infrastructure Status Report
10/02/2015	12.2	Development & Environmental Services Status Report
10/02/2015	12.3	Mobile Food Vendors Policy & Procedure
10/02/2015	12.4	Late Item - SA Power Networks Easement Letter of Agreement at Allotments 11 & 12 Seaview Road Kingscote
10/02/2015	13.1	Notice of Motion Cr Connell - Kingscote Hospital Parking
10/02/2015	15.1	Correspondence for Information - Various
10/02/2015	15.2	Late Item - Correspondence for Information
10/02/2015	17.2	Cr Kauppila - Bio Security signage for Kangaroo Island within the Yankalilla District Council area to be installed - Question taken on notice - Chief Executive Officer Cr Tydeman - Commissioner for Kangaroo Island - Will Council have representation on the Selection Panel.
10/02/2015	18.1	Rates Payment Arrangement
10/02/2015	18.2	Rates
10/03/2015	5.1	Mayor's Report
10/03/2015	9.1	Finance Committee Minutes
10/03/2015	9.2	Community Centres Committee Meeting - 12 February 2015
10/03/2015	9.3	Boating Facilities Committee Meeting - 12 February 2015
10/03/2015	10.1	Chief Executive Officer Activities / Meetings
10/03/2015	10.2	Flood Recovery - Status Report
10/03/2015	11.1	Business Support Status Report
10/03/2015	11.2	Dog & Cat Management Fees
10/03/2015	11.3	Public Consultation: Naming of Cordes Reserve
10/03/2015	11.4	KI TOMM Residents Survey 2014-15
10/03/2015	12.1	Development Services Status Report
10/03/2015	12.2	Emu Bay Development Plan Amendment (DPA) - Adoption of Section 101A Committee Minutes.
10/03/2015	12.3	Asset Services Status Report
10/03/2015	12.4	Mining Lease EML 5425
10/03/2015	14.1	Office of Nick Xenophon, Independent Senator for South Australia - Pensioner Concessions
10/03/2015	14.2	Australian Local Government Association - National General Assembly of Local Government
10/03/2015	15.1	Correspondence for information - Various
10/03/2015	17.1	Urgent Business
10/03/2015	18.1	Sale of Properties - Non payment of rates
26/03/2015	3.1	Code of Conduct 2015/03
26/03/2015	4.1	Closure by Mayor
14/04/2015	5.1	Mayor's Report
14/04/2015	6.1	Questions from the Gallery
14/04/2015	10.1	Chief Executive Officer Activities / Meetings
14/04/2015	10.2	Kangaroo Island Racing Club Sponsorship
14/04/2015	10.3	Brennan v Kangaroo Island Council
14/04/2015	10.4	Feral Cat Management Initiatives
14/04/2015	10.5	Budget Amendment
14/04/2015	11.1	Business Support Status Report
14/04/2015	11.2	Public Consultation: Naming of Vigars Way or Vigars Lane, Parndana
14/04/2015	11.3	Finance Quarterly Report

14/04/2015	11.4	Kingscote Airport Farming Land Lease
14/04/2015	11.5	Public Consultation Report - Annual Business Plan & Budget 2015-16
14/04/2015	11.6	Finance Quarterly Report
14/04/2015	11.7	Finance Quarterly Status Report
14/04/2015	12.1	Deposit Plan of Division - Council is an affected party to the Deposit for Titles - Harvie 520/D015/14 - Lot 73 Wrights Road Penneshaw.
14/04/2015	12.2	Proposed Land Management Agreement - Rothe - Allotment 95 FP180937 Hundred of Dudley - DA 520/D018/14.
14/04/2015	12.3	Development and Environmental Services Status Report
14/04/2015	12.4	Indenture
14/04/2015	12.5	Town Hall Facade
14/04/2015	12.6	Asset Services & Infrastructure Reports
14/04/2015	13.1	Notice of Motion Cr Denholm - SA Commissioner of Police
14/04/2015	13.2	Notice of Motion Cr Masters - Weed spraying of paths
14/04/2015	14.1	FRWA - Finance Report to December 2014 and Mid Year Budget Review
14/04/2015	14.2	Concession on Council Rates - Community Petition
14/04/2015	14.3	Business Kangaroo Island - Membership
14/04/2015	14.4	Kangaroo Island Health Service - Aboriginal and Torres Strait Islander issues
14/04/2015	14.5	UN Youth Australia National Conference 2015 - Gerard Snowball
14/04/2015	15.1	Correspondence for Information - Various
14/04/2015	17.1	Urgent Business
14/04/2015	18.1	Soldier Memorial Gates - Kingscote
14/04/2015	18.2	Information & Communication Technology (ICT) - Service Agreement (In-Confidence)
14/04/2015	18.3	Code of Conduct 2015/02
30/04/2015	3.1	Code of Conduct 2015/04
05/05/2015	3.1	Code of Conduct 2015/04
12/05/2015	5.1	Mayor's Report
12/05/2015	6.1	Questions from the Gallery
12/05/2015	9.1	Finance Committee Minutes
12/05/2015	9.2	Audit Committee Minutes
12/05/2015	10.1	Chief Executive Officer Activities / Meetings
12/05/2015	10.2	Tourism KI - Lease of Penneshaw Premises
12/05/2015	10.3	Late Report - Australias Small Island Fourm - Norfolk Island 14 - 17 September 2015
12/05/2015	11.1	Business Support Status Report
12/05/2015	11.2	Property Settlement - Sale of Property
12/05/2015	11.3	Draft Annual Business Plan 2015-16
12/05/2015	11.4	Finance Policy Review
12/05/2015	11.5	Discretionary Rebate Report
12/05/2015	11.6	Community Art Mini-Orb Wall
12/05/2015	11.7	Soldiers Memorial Park Project
12/05/2015	12.1	Asset Services & Infrastructure Status Reports
12/05/2015	12.2	Parking Register Additions
12/05/2015	12.3	Emu Bay DPA - Submission to Minister & Proposed Amendment
12/05/2015	12.4	Development & Environmental Services Status Report
12/05/2015	12.5	Scheduled Review - Building Inspection Policy (Section 80AB of the Development Regulations 2008)
12/05/2015	14.1	Local Government Association (LGA) Finance Assistance Grants
12/05/2015	15.1	Correspondence for Information - Various

12/05/2015	16.1	Notifications & Report Requests
12/05/2015	17.1	Urgent Business
12/05/2015	18.1	Late Report - Request for Rates Refund/Waiver
12/05/2015	18.2	Verbal Briefing regarding 10.1 Chief Executive Officer Activities / Meetings Report.
09/06/2015	5.1	Mayor's Report
09/06/2015	8.1.1	Questions of Notice - Cr Ken Liu
09/06/2015	9.1	Boating Facilities Committee - Thursday, 9 April 2015
09/06/2015	9.2	Community Centres Committee - Thursday, 9 April 2015
09/06/2015	9.3	Kangaroo Island Youth Council Minutes
09/06/2015	10.1	Chief Executive Officer Activities / Meetings
09/06/2015	10.2	RIG - Internal Review
09/06/2015	11.1	Business Support Status Report
09/06/2015	11.2	Public Consultation Report - Annual Business Plan & Budget 2015-16
09/06/2015	11.3	Finance Policies
09/06/2015	11.4	Adoption of Annual Business Plan 2015-16
09/06/2015	11.5	2015-16 FRWA Budget
09/06/2015	11.6	Adoption of Annual Budget 2015-16
09/06/2015	11.7	Adoption of 2015/16 Valuations
09/06/2015	11.8	Declaration of 2015/16 Differential General Rates & Fixed Charge
09/06/2015	11.9	Declaration of Separate Rate - Regional NRM Levy
09/06/2015	11.10	Declaration of Annual Service Charge - Waste Management 2015/16
09/06/2015	11.11	Declaration of Annual Service Charge - Community Wastewater Management System (CWMS) for 2015/16
09/06/2015	11.12	Payment of Rates
09/06/2015	11.13	Schedule of Fees & Charges 2015/16
09/06/2015	11.14	Update to Schedule of 'Non-Replaced' Assets
09/06/2015	11.15	Rockhopper Update
09/06/2015	11.16	Public Consultation Policy
09/06/2015	11.17	General Complaint Policy 2015
09/06/2015	11.18	Terms of Reference
09/06/2015	11.19	Penneshaw Community Business Centre Lease and Service Agreement
09/06/2015	11.20	Asset Accounting Policy
09/06/2015	11.21	EO Report: Airport Land Lease
09/06/2015	11.22	EO Report: Gallery Lease [KI Art Society]
09/06/2015	11.23	LGFA Borrowings
09/06/2015	11.24	Authorised Persons Association Conference
09/06/2015	12.1	Asset Services & Infrastructure Status Reports
09/06/2015	12.2	Proposed Land Management Agreement - Baillie Lodges Pty. Ltd. and Hanson Bay Company Pty. Ltd. - Allotment comprising Pieces Q10, Q11 & Q12 DP25953 and Allotment 9 DP25953 Hundred of McDonald - DA 520/D020/14.
09/06/2015	12.3	Southern & Hills LGA Regional Health Plan - Final Amendment - For Approval
09/06/2015	12.4	Parking Register Addition - Osmond Street
09/06/2015	12.5	Infrastructure and Asset Management Plans
09/06/2015	12.6	Dauncey Street Sealing Postponement
09/06/2015	12.7	FRWA Fees & Charges at KIRRC
09/06/2015	12.8	Development & Environmental Services Department Status Report.
09/06/2015	12.9	Mobile Food Vendors Policy - For Approval.

09/06/2015	12.10	Asset Services & Infrastructure reports
09/06/2015	13.1	Notice of Motion - Cr Denholm
09/06/2015	13.2	Notice of Motion Cr Denholm
09/06/2015	15.1	Correspondence for Information - Various
09/06/2015	18.1	In-confidence Items - Annual Review
09/06/2015	18.2	Notice of Motion - Cr Connell
09/06/2015	18.3	2015-01 - 2015-03 Code of Conducts Update
14/07/2015	5.1	Mayors Report
14/07/2015	9.1	Boating Facilities Committee - Thursday, 11 June 2015
14/07/2015	10.1	Chief Executive Officer Activities / Meetings
14/07/2015	10.2	Cessna 182 Association of Australia
14/07/2015	10.3	Report on Internal Review of Council Decisions
14/07/2015	10.4	August Council Meeting - Change of Date
14/07/2015	10.5	ESCOSA Water Licence. Continued Delegation to the CEO
14/07/2015	11.01	Business Support Department Status Report
14/07/2015	11.2	Community Capital Infrastructure Grant - Lessons Learned Process
14/07/2015	11.3	Cost of Living Concessions
14/07/2015	11.4	General Complaint Policy 2015
14/07/2015	11.5	Finance Quarterly Report - June 2015
14/07/2015	11.6	Expressions of Interest: Rainwater Tanks
14/07/2015	11.7	Model Ships: The Duke of York and the Investigator
14/07/2015	11.8	Youth Sponsorship Program
14/07/2015	11.9	Public Consultation: Public Consultation Policy
14/07/2015	11.10	Public Consultation: Council Grant Policy
14/07/2015	11.11	Public Consultation: Asset Accounting Policy
14/07/2015	11.12	Penneshaw Community Business Centre: Request for Electricity Costs Waiver
14/07/2015	11.13	Social Media Policy
14/07/2015	11.14	Council Youth Mural Wall
14/07/2015	11.15	Finance Quarterly Report - June 2016
14/07/2015	12.1	Development & Environmental Services Status Report
14/07/2015	12.2	MacGillivray Flood Recovery
14/07/2015	12.3	Asset Services & Infrastructure Status Reports
14/07/2015	13.1	Notice of Motion - Cr Denholm
14/07/2015	13.2	Rescind Motion - Cr Kauppila
14/07/2015	14.1	Flying the Rainbow Flag - Celebrating Diversity
14/07/2015	14.2	Local Government Finance Authority
14/07/2015	14.3	Wattle Range Council
14/07/2015	14.4	FRWA Business Plan 2014 - 2017 Review 1 - June 2015
14/07/2015	14.5	Regional Development Australia - Constitution
14/07/2015	15.1	Correspondence for Information - Various
14/07/2015	17.1	Urgent Business - Maree Baldwin
14/07/2015	18.1	In-Confidence Cr Liu - Camper Vans on Public Places
14/07/2015	18.2	Penneshaw CWMS - Verbal Update
12/08/2015	5.1	Mayors report
12/08/2015	10.1	Chief Executive Officer Activities / Meetings
12/08/2015	10.2	Ombudsmans Final Report Cr Willson
12/08/2015	10.3	Adams Street Road Closure and Land Division Emu Bay
12/08/2015	10.4	Basic Review / Update. Policies
12/08/2015	10.5	Mandatory Policies. Review and continued Adoption

12/08/2015	10.6	Revised Media Policy for Council review and re-Adoption
12/08/2015	10.7	Mr Walkom FOI Determination
12/08/2015	10.8	Late Report - Kangaroo Island Airport Upgrade
12/08/2015	10.9	Late Report - Final Report from Ombudsman SA Investigation in response to a referral from ICAC
12/08/2015	10.10	Late Report - SABFAC Funding Submission Upgrade of Emu Bay Boating Facility
12/08/2015	11.01	Business Support Department Status Report
12/08/2015	11.02	Internal Control Policy Review
12/08/2015	11.03	Sponsorship Program FY14-15
12/08/2015	11.04	Library Policy for Review and Adoption
12/08/2015	11.05	Street Numbering for Townships & Coastal Settlements
12/08/2015	11.06	Development and Environmental Services Status Report
12/08/2015	11.07	Strategic Directions Report for consultation
12/08/2015	11.08	Airport Property Lease
12/08/2015	11.09	Concession Request - Kangaroo Island Animal Support Inc.
12/08/2015	11.10	Emu Bay DPA - Correspondence from Minister Rau Regarding Authorisation of DPA.
12/08/2015	11.11	Late Report - Birchmore Bowling Club Grant
12/08/2015	12.1	Asset Services & Infrastructure Status Reports
12/08/2015	12.2	Mining Lease - Lot 50 North Coast Rd
12/08/2015	14.1	Mayor Joy Baluch AM, request to contribute to a bronzed life-sized sculptured statue.
12/08/2015	14.2	Kangaroo Island Energy Security Focus Group
12/08/2015	14.3	Notice of Annual General Meeting - Australian Coastal Councils Association, 17 September 2015
12/08/2015	15.1	Correspondence for Information - Various
12/08/2015	17.1	Urgent Business
12/08/2015	18.1	Legal Matter
12/08/2015	18.2	Code of Conduct 2015/04
12/08/2015	18.3	Code of Conduct 2015/05
12/08/2015		Personal Statement by Cr Willson
08/09/2015	5.1	Mayor's report
08/09/2015	8.1.1	Questions on Notice - Cr Liu
08/09/2015	8.1.2	Questions on Notice - Cr Liu -Expenses on Code of Conduct Complaints
08/09/2015	9.1	Boating Facilities Committee Minutes - Friday 14 August 2015
08/09/2015	9.2	Community Centres Committee - Friday 14 August 2015
08/09/2015	9.3	Kangaroo Island Youth Council Minutes
08/09/2015	9.4	Community Passenger Network Committee Minutes - 20 August 2015
08/09/2015	10.1	Chief Executive Officer Activities / Meetings
08/09/2015	10.2	Land Management Agreement - relating to the Penneshaw Wastewater Treatment Facility
08/09/2015	10.3	Hardship Policy for Residential Customers of Minor and Intermediate Water Retailers.
08/09/2015	11.1	Business Support Department Status Report
08/09/2015	11.2	Development Services Status Report
08/09/2015	11.3	Public Consultation: KI Resource Recovery Centre - Fees & Charges
08/09/2015	11.4	Concession for Up-front Payment of Christmas Cove Marina Berth rental fees.

08/09/2015	11.5	2015/16 Community Capital Infrastructure Grant - American River Community and Sports Association, - Parndana Bowling Club, - Parndana Sports Club, - MacGillivray Cricket Club, - Stokes Bay Community Hall, - Western Districts Memorial Community & Sports Centre,
08/09/2015	11.6	2015/16 Community Capital Infrastructure Grant - Junction Australia
08/09/2015	12.1	Asset Services & Infrastructure status reports
08/09/2015	15.1	Correspondence for Information - Various
08/09/2015	18.1	Code of Conduct 2015/07
29/09/2015	3.1	Planning, Development & Infrastructure Bill 2015 Response
13/10/2015	5.1	Mayor's Report
13/10/2015	8.1.1	Questions on Notice - Cr Liu -Expenses on Code of Conduct Complaints
13/10/2015	8.1.2	Questions on notice - Cr K Liu - Sealink Terminal Building Builder
13/10/2015	8.1.3	Question on Notice - Cr K Liu - Footpaths
13/10/2015	8.1.4	Question on Notice - Cr G Connell - Roadside Vegetation Management Plan
13/10/2015	8.1.5	Questions on Notice - Cr Liu Penneshaw CWMS
13/10/2015	10.1	Chief Executive Officer Activites / Meetings
13/10/2015	10.2	Penneshaw CWMS
13/10/2015	10.3	Public Consultation - Kangaroo Island Airport Upgrade
13/10/2015	11.1	Business Support Status Report
13/10/2015	11.2	Internal Control Policy
13/10/2015	11.3	Library Policy
13/10/2015	11.4	Street Numbering for Townships & Coastal Settlements - Oct'15
13/10/2015	11.5	Finance Quarterly Report - September 2015
13/10/2015	11.6	Social Media Policy - Post Consultation - For Adoption.
13/10/2015	11.7	Development & Environmental Services Status Report
13/10/2015	11.8	CWMS Customer Charter (Policy).
13/10/2015	12.1	Asset Services & Infrastructure status reports
13/10/2015	13.1	Notice of Motion - Cr P Denholm - Junction Australia
13/10/2015	15.1	Correspondence for Information - Various
13/10/2015	18.1	In Confidence Report - Island Development #1
13/10/2015	18.2	In Confidence Report - Island Development #2
13/10/2015	18.3	Confidential report to Mayor
10/11/2015	5.1	Mayors Report
10/11/2015	6.1	Questions from the Gallery
10/11/2015	8.1.1	Questions on Notice - Cr Liu -Expenses on Code of Conduct Complaints
10/11/2015	8.1.2	Question on Notice - Cr Denholm
10/11/2015	8.1.3	Question on Notice - Cr Connell
10/11/2015	9.1	Boating Facilities Committee Minutes - Thursday 22 October 2015
10/11/2015	9.2	Community Centres Committee - Thursday 22 October 2015
10/11/2015	9.3	Audit Committee Minutes
10/11/2015	10.1	Chief Executive Officer Activites / Meetings
10/11/2015	10.2	Deputy Mayor Appointment
10/11/2015	10.3	Penneshaw CWMS Easements
10/11/2015	10.4	Committee Representation
10/11/2015	10.5	Code of Practice review
10/11/2015	10.6	Prudential Review of Airport Upgrade project
10/11/2015	10.7	Penneshaw CWMS Update
10/11/2015	11.1	New Borrowings
10/11/2015	11.2	Business Support Status Report
10/11/2015	11.3	Street Numbering for Townships & Coastal Settlements - November 2015

10/11/2015	11.4	Council Policies undergoing basic post-Election review and logo update.
10/11/2015	11.5	Council Policies undergoing basic post-Election review and minor amendment.
10/11/2015	11.6	Council Policy undergoing substantive amendment
10/11/2015	11.7	Development & Environmental Services Status Report
10/11/2015	11.8	Audit Committee Annual Report
10/11/2015	11.9	Late report - Leases, Licences and Permits Policy
10/11/2015	12.1	Asset Services & Infrastructure Status Reports
10/11/2015	12.2	Parndana Speed Zone change
10/11/2015	12.3	Penneshaw Parking Register Additions
10/11/2015	12.4	Late report - Pipeline Indenture- Centenary Avenue
10/11/2015	13.1	Notice of Motion - Cr Denholm
10/11/2015	15.1	Correspondence for Information - Various
10/11/2015	18.1	CEO Performance Review - Final report
08/12/2015	5.1	Mayor's report
08/12/2015	8.1.1	Cr Ken Liu - CWMS Policy & Connection Costs
08/12/2015	8.1.2	Legal Expenditure 2014/15
08/12/2015	9.1	Adoption of Section 101A Strategic Planning Committee Minutes of 26/11/2015.
08/12/2015	9.2	Boating Facilities Committee Minutes - Wednesday 25 November 2015
08/12/2015	9.3	Community Centres Committee Minutes - Wednesday, 25 November 2015
08/12/2015	9.4	Finance Committee Minutes - Wednesday, 18 November 2015
08/12/2015	10.1	CEO Activities / Meetings
08/12/2015	10.2	Amendment to Register of Interests
08/12/2015	10.3	Resignation from Cr Graeme Connell
08/12/2015	10.4	Committee Representation due to resignation
08/12/2015	10.5	Ombudsman's Report - Cr K Liu
08/12/2015	10.6	Internal Review of Council Decision - request by Mr Graham Walkom
08/12/2015	10.7	LATE REPORT - Kangaroo Island Airport Upgrade Project
08/12/2015	11.1	Emu Bay Beach: Shared Zone Speed Limit
08/12/2015	11.2	Mobile Food Vendors Policy - 6 month Trial Period Review
08/12/2015	11.3	Development & Environmental Services - Status Report
08/12/2015	11.4	Business Support Report
08/12/2015	11.5	Capt Morgan Park - Community Land Management Plan Amendment
08/12/2015	11.6	2015/16 Community Capital Infrastructure Grant - Second Quarter Applications
08/12/2015	11.7	Street Numbering for Townships & Coastal Settlements - December 2015
08/12/2015	11.8	Policies for adoption post Community Consultation
08/12/2015	12.1	K I Motor Club Time Trial Road Closure Request
08/12/2015	12.2	Asset Services & Infrastructure status reports
08/12/2015	12.3	Late Report - Kingscote Town Hall Facade Final Cost Report
08/12/2015	15.1	Correspondence for Information - Various
08/12/2015	17.1	Urgent Business - Cr P Masters
08/12/2015	18.1	Legal Advice
08/12/2015	18.2	Late report Legal Advice #2
08/12/2015	18.3	In Confidence Items
08/12/2015	18.4	Motions Laying on the table
19/01/2016	5.1	Mayor's Report
19/01/2016	9.1	Audit Committee Minutes 9 December 2015
19/01/2016	10.1	CEO Activities / Meetings

19/01/2016	10.2	Dry Zone - 2016 KI Cup Carnival
19/01/2016	10.3	Pelican Lagoon Conservation Park - proposed closure of unmade public roads
19/01/2016	10.4	Mayor's Attendance at the World Small Islands Conference in Greece
19/01/2016	10.5	Bellmore Road and Dover Farm through road access
19/01/2016	11.1	Asset Services Report
19/01/2016	11.2	Business Support Reports
19/01/2016	11.3	Development & Environmental Services - Status Report
19/01/2016	11.4	Street Numbering for Townships & Coastal Settlements - January 2016
19/01/2016	12.1	Murray Street Pedestrian Crossing Request
19/01/2016	12.2	Road name at DeEstree Bay
19/01/2016	15.1	Correspondence for Information - various
19/01/2016	17.1	Urgent Business
09/02/2016	5.1	Mayor's Report
09/02/2016	10.1	Chief Executive Officer Activities / Meetings
09/02/2016	10.2	Adams Street Road Closure - Emu Bay
09/02/2016	10.3	Informal Gathering Policy
09/02/2016	10.4	FRWA Kerbside Collection Changes
09/02/2016	10.5	American River Community Hall
09/02/2016	11.1	Business Support Status Reports
09/02/2016	11.3	Island Care
09/02/2016	11.4	Development & Environmental Services February Status Report
09/02/2016	12.1	Asset Services Status Report
09/02/2016	12.2	Nat Thomas Street Event Closure
09/02/2016	12.3	Gallery Car Park
09/02/2016	13.1	Cr Denholm - American River
09/02/2016	14.1	Cherie Tyley - Australia Day Nominations
09/02/2016	15.1	Correspondence for Information - various
09/02/2016	17.1	Urgent Business
25/02/2016	3.1	Kangaroo Island Airport Upgrade Project - Commonwealth Funding Agreement
08/03/2016	5.1	Mayor's Report
08/03/2016	9.1	Community Centres Committee Meeting Minutes - Thursday, 11 February 2016
08/03/2016	9.2	Boating Facilities Committee Meeting Minutes - Thursday, 11 February 2016
08/03/2016	9.3	Community Passanger Network Committee Minutes 4 February 2016
08/03/2016	9.4	Finance Committee Meeting Minutes
08/03/2016	9.5	Audit Committee Minutes 7 March 2016
08/03/2016	10.1	CEO Activities / Meetings
08/03/2016	10.2	Parndana Sports Club Loan Guarantor Request
08/03/2016	10.3	Boating Facilities Committee representation
08/03/2016	11.1	Business Support Status Reports
08/03/2016	11.2	Dog & Cat Management Fees
08/03/2016	11.3	Finance Quarterly Report - December 2015
08/03/2016	11.4	Street Numbering for Townships & Coastal Settlements - March 2016
08/03/2016	11.5	Records Management Policy Amendment
08/03/2016	11.6	Development & Environmental Services Status Report
08/03/2016	11.7	Informal Gathering Policy
08/03/2016	12.1	Asset Services Status Report
08/03/2016	14.1	Correspondence from American River Progress Association

08/03/2016	14.2	Local Government Association Showcase & Ordinary General Meeting
08/03/2016	14.3	Australian Local Government Association - National General Assembly of Local Government
08/03/2016	15.1	Correspondence for information - various
08/03/2016	15.2	Final Report from Ombudsman
08/03/2016	17.1	Urgent Business
08/03/2016	18.1	Audit Committee Minutes - In-confidence report
08/03/2016	18.2	Late Item - In-confidence - City of Holdfast Bay Correspondence
15/03/2016	3.1	Response to Member for Finniss Parliamentary statement
12/04/2016	5.1	Mayor's Report
12/04/2016	8.1.1	Question on Notice - Cr Liu - Emu Bay Boat Ramp Upgrade
12/04/2016	9.1	Community Passenger Network Committee Meeting Minutes - 2 March 2016 and 22 March 2016
12/04/2016	10.1	CEO Activities / Meetings
12/04/2016	10.2	Southern & Hills Local Government Association request for an extension to the current exemption from the requirement to have a separate Audit Committee
12/04/2016	10.3	Arts & Culture Officer - Co-funding opportunity with Country Arts SA
12/04/2016	10.4	Memorandum of Understanding - Car Parking Regulation - Penneshaw
12/04/2016	10.5	Visible Solar Project - Update for 2015
12/04/2016	10.6	Initiation of Representation Review
12/04/2016	10.7	Public Consultation Policy Amendment
12/04/2016	11.1	Road Name at D'estrees Bay
12/04/2016	11.2	Street Name in Penneshaw
12/04/2016	11.3	Business Support Status Report
12/04/2016	11.4	Public Consultation Report - Annual Business Plan & Budget 2016-17
12/04/2016	11.5	Airport Charges & Fees
12/04/2016	11.6	Future of the Community Passenger Network on Kangaroo Island
12/04/2016	11.7	Finance Quarterly Report - March 2016
12/04/2016	11.8	Development Services Status Report
12/04/2016	11.9	Kangaroo Island Recreational and Sports Strategy
12/04/2016	12.1	Asset Services & Infrastructure Reports
12/04/2016	13.1	Cr Ricketts - Kingscote Structure Plan Workshop
12/04/2016	15.1	Correspondence for information - various
12/04/2016		16 Notifications & Report Requests
12/04/2016		Urgent Business
28/04/2016	3.1	Japanese Study Tour
10/05/2016	5.1	Mayor's report
10/05/2016	8.1.1	Questions on Notice - Cr Ken Liu
10/05/2016	9.1	Community Passenger Network Committee Meeting Minutes - 20 April 2016
10/05/2016	9.2	Boating Facilities Committee Meeting of 7 April 2016
10/05/2016	9.3	Communities Centres Committee Meeting of 7 April 2016
10/05/2016	9.4	Finance Committee Meeting held 2 May 2016
10/05/2016	9.5	Audit Committee Meeting held 2 May 2016
10/05/2016	10.1	CEO Meetings / Activies
10/05/2016	10.2	Commissioner for KI - Local Advisory Board
10/05/2016	10.3	Ministerial Request for Assistance with Community Land Dedication Revocation Public Consultation Process
10/05/2016	10.4	Appointment of Deputy Mayor
10/05/2016	10.5	2017-18 Annual Business Plan & Budget consultation dates

10/05/2016	11.1	Business Support Status Report
10/05/2016	11.2	Development & Environmental Services Status Report
10/05/2016	11.3	Council Lands Management Plan - For Approval for Public Consultation
10/05/2016	11.4	Community Consultation Policy - Consultation Feedback
10/05/2016	11.5	Finance Policies Review
10/05/2016	11.6	Street Numbering for Townships & Coastal Settlements - May 2016
10/05/2016	11.7	Draft Annual Business Plan 2016-17
10/05/2016	11.8	Late Report - 2016/17 FRWA Budget
10/05/2016	12.1	Asset Services & Infrastructure Status Reports
10/05/2016	15.1	Correspondence for Information - Various
10/05/2016		Questions from the Gallery - Mr Andy Young.
26/05/2016	3.1	Annual Business Plan & Budget 2016-17 - Public Consultation
21/06/2016	5.1	Mayor's Report
21/06/2016	5.2	Late Report - Mayor's report - ISISA Conference Lesvos Island Greece
21/06/2016	8.1.1	Questions on Notice - Cr Liu
21/06/2016	8.1.2	Question on Notice - Cr Liu
21/06/2016	9.1	Community Passenger Network Committee Meeting Minutes - 24 May 2016
21/06/2016	9.2	Community Centre's Committee Meeting of 9 June 2016
21/06/2016	9.3	Boating Facilities Committee Meeting of 9 June 2016
21/06/2016	10.1	CEO Activities / Meetings
21/06/2016	10.2	Regional Development Australia & Kangaroo Island Council Funding Agreement
21/06/2016	10.3	Final Report from Ombudsman ref 2015/04218
21/06/2016	10.4	Annual Business Plan & Budget 2017/18 - Consultation dates
21/06/2016	10.5	Inconfidence register - Annual review
21/06/2016	10.7	Proclaimed Shopping Districts
21/06/2016	11.1	Public Consultation Report - Annual Business Plan & Budget 2016/17
21/06/2016	11.2	Business Support Status Report
21/06/2016	11.3	Finance Policies
21/06/2016	11.4	Adoption of Annual Business Plan 2016-17
21/06/2016	11.5	Adoption of Annual Budget 2016/17
21/06/2016	11.6	Adoption of 2016/17 Valuations
21/06/2016	11.7	Declaration of 2016/17 Differential General Rates & Fixed Charge
21/06/2016	11.8	Declaration of Separate Rate - Regional NRM Levy
21/06/2016	11.9	Declaration of Annual Service Charge - Waste Management 2016/17
21/06/2016	11.10	Resilient Hills & Coasts - Draft Regional Climate Change Adaption Plan
21/06/2016	11.11	Declaration of Annual Service Charge - Community Wastewater Management System (CWMS) for 2016/17
21/06/2016	11.12	Payment of Rates
21/06/2016	11.13	Schedule of Fees and Charges 2016/17
21/06/2016	11.14	Update to Schedule of 'Non-Replace' Assets
21/06/2016	11.15	Dissolution of the Section 41 Youth Advisory Committee and associated administrative requirements.
21/06/2016	11.16	Kerbside Waste Collection Proposed Changes - Public Consultation Period
21/06/2016	11.17	Dissolving the Section 41 Community Passenger Network Committee
21/06/2016	11.18	Community Capital Infrastructure Grant Program - Annual Review
21/06/2016	11.19	Development Services Status Report
21/06/2016	11.20	Update of Long Term Financial Plan
21/06/2016	11.21	Elector Representation Review Options Paper
21/06/2016	12.1	Asset Services & Infrastructure report

21/06/2016	12.2	Indenture Request - Arafura Avenue
21/06/2016	12.3	Island Beach Road Revised Speed Zoning
21/06/2016	12.4	Indenture Request - Lukenna Court
21/06/2016	13.1	Cr Ricketts - Kangaroo Island Council Consultation Panel
21/06/2016	13.2	Notice of Motion - Cr Liu
21/06/2016	14.1	Correspondence for discussion - Dan van Holst Pellekaan MP - Regional Health Services
21/06/2016	14.2	Correspondence for Discussion - KIRSC Correspondence
21/06/2016	14.3	Correspondence for discussion - Commissioner for KI Transformation Project
21/06/2016	15.1	Correspondence for information
11/07/2016	5.1	Minutes of Meeting held 11.04.2016
12/07/2016	5.1	Mayor's report
12/07/2016	10.1	CEO Activities / Meetings
12/07/2016	10.2	American River Hall
12/07/2016	11.1	Business Support Status Report
12/07/2016	11.2	Development & Environmental Services Status Report
12/07/2016	11.3	Amendment of Fees Wavering Involving Penneshaw Cemetery Headstones & Monumentation
12/07/2016	11.4	Council Lands Management Plan - Post Consultation Summary and Recommendations - For Adoption & Submission to the Minister.
12/07/2016	11.5	Finance Quarterly Report - June 2016
12/07/2016	12.1	Asset Services & Infrastructure report
12/07/2016	14.1	Review of FRWA Charter V3-2016
12/07/2016	15.1	Correspondence for Information
12/07/2016	8.1.1	Cr Liu - Emu Bay Boat Ramp
12/07/2016	8.1.2	Cr Liu - Parndana Stormwater Reuse Study Report
12/07/2016		Question without notice - Cr P Masters - American River Hall
09/08/2016	5.1	Mayors Report
09/08/2016	6.1	Sue Florance - Community Capital Infrastructure Grant Program CCIGP
09/08/2016	8.1.1	Questions on Notice - Cr Liu - Parndana Stormwater Reuse Study Report
09/08/2016	9.1	Boating Facilities Committee Meeting of 21 July 2016
09/08/2016	9.2	Community Centres Committee Meeting of 21 July 2016
09/08/2016	9.3	Awards and Grants Assessment Panel Meeting of 21 July 2016
09/08/2016	10.1	CEO Activities / Meetings
09/08/2016	10.2	American River Hall
09/08/2016	10.3	Wisanger Road Opening & Closing Responses
09/08/2016	10.4	Proclaimed Shopping Districts Community Consultation
09/08/2016	10.5	Local Advisory Board for Economic Growth on Kangaroo Island - Panel appointment
09/08/2016	11.1	Business Support Status Report
09/08/2016	11.2	International Small Islands Studies Association 2017 Conference
09/08/2016	11.3	Kangaroo Island Social Media Alliance (KISMA) - Social Media Project funding
09/08/2016	11.4	Commissioner for KI Transformation Project Funding
09/08/2016	11.5	Shipping Container on Land Policy - Approval for Public Consultation
09/08/2016	11.6	Development & Environmental Services Department Status Report
09/08/2016	11.7	Development & Environmental Services - Major Environmental, Land Management & Policy Documents 2015/16 - For Information Report.

09/08/2016	11.8	Community Consultation Report - Amendment to Fees and Charges Schedule: Breeding Cats
09/08/2016	12.1	Asset Services & Infrastructure Report
09/08/2016	12.2	Changes to Franklin Street Parking
09/08/2016	12.3	Pedestrian Crossings - Standard Information
09/08/2016	12.4	Council contribution to emergency incidents
09/08/2016	14.1	Correspondence for Discussion - Local Government Finance Authority (LGFA) Annual General Meeting
09/08/2016	14.2	Correspondence for Discussion - Review of the Community Wastewater Management Schemes (CWMS) Funding Agreement
09/08/2016	14.3	Local Government Finance Authority - Election for Positions of Representative on the Board of Trustees
09/08/2016	15.1	Correspondence for Information - Various
09/08/2016	16.1	Notifications & Report Requests
09/08/2016	17.1	Urgent Business
31/08/2016	3.1	Kingscote Wharf EOI Submission
13/09/2016	5.1	Mayors Report
13/09/2016	7.1	Petition - Chapman Terrace Vegetation Clearance
13/09/2016	8.1.1	Questions on Notice - Cr Liu - Desludge of Septic Tanks
13/09/2016	8.1.2	Questions on Notice - Cr Denholm - Wind monitoring / Sealing Penneshaw Streets / Traffic Management Plan / RDA Agreement
13/09/2016	8.1.3	Questions on Notice - Cr Denholm - North Cape Road
13/09/2016	8.1.4	Questions on Notice - Cr Liu - Penneshaw Parking Management Plan
13/09/2016	10.1	CEO Activities / Meetings
13/09/2016	10.2	Resilient Hills & Coast Adaptation Plan
13/09/2016	10.3	Proclaimed Shopping Districts: Action
13/09/2016	10.4	Elector Representation Review. Options Paper Consultation Results
13/09/2016	11.1	Business Support Status Report
13/09/2016	11.2	Vivonne Bay Beach Access Track - Grant Funding
13/09/2016	11.3	FRWA Kerbside Collection
13/09/2016	11.4	Kingscote Men's Shed Inc Sponsorship Request
13/09/2016	11.5	Development & Environmental Services Department Status Report
13/09/2016	11.6	Christmas Cove Marina Management Plan 2016-2018
13/09/2016	11.7	Karatta Stone Reserve Lease
13/09/2016	12.1	Electrical Indenture Request
13/09/2016	12.2	Water Pipe Indenture Request
13/09/2016	12.3	Kangaroo Island Art Society Incorporated - Lease Review
13/09/2016	12.4	Asset Services & Infrastructure status report
13/09/2016	12.5	Bridges Renewal Programme Funding Deed
13/09/2016	12.6	2016/17 Australian Government Black Spot Programme Funding Deed
13/09/2016	14.1	Commissioner for KI - Draft Housing Management Plan
13/09/2016	14.2	Hon Geoff Brock MP - Draft Local Government Boundary Adjustment Amendment Bill 2016
13/09/2016	14.3	Press Release - Dusk to Dawn Speed Limits on Kangaroo Island
13/09/2016	14.4	Call for Nominations for LGA President, Board Members & Deputy Board Members
13/09/2016	14.5	American River Progress Association - American River Hall & Lot 1 Tangara Drive
13/09/2016	14.6	Commissioner for KI - Local Advisory Board for Native Vegetation

13/09/2016	14.7	Local Government Finance Authority - Election for Positions of Representative on the Board of Trustees
13/09/2016	15.1	Correspondence for Information
11/10/2016	5.1	Mayors Report
11/10/2016	8.1.1	Questions on Notice - Cr Liu - Desludge of Septic Tanks
11/10/2016	8.1.2	Questions on Notice - Cr Liu - Penneshaw Parking Management Plan
11/10/2016	8.1.3	Connection to Penneshaw CWMS Scheme - Cr Liu
11/10/2016	9.1	Boating Facilities Committee Minutes 22 September 2016
11/10/2016	9.2	Community Centres Committee Minutes 22 September 2016
11/10/2016	10.1	CEO Activities / Meetings
11/10/2016	10.2	Council Delegation of Authority to the CEO
11/10/2016	10.3	Appointment of the KI Building Fire Safety Committee
11/10/2016	10.4	Electoral Representation Review Report
11/10/2016	10.5	CWMS Service Charge Exemption Requests
11/10/2016	11.1	Dissolution of Section 41 Committee Community Centres
11/10/2016	11.2	Business Support Status Report
11/10/2016	11.3	Camping and Boating Facilities Terms and Conditions
11/10/2016	11.4	Quarterly Finance Status Report - September 2016
11/10/2016	11.5	Development & Environmental Services Department Status Report
11/10/2016	11.6	Shipping Containers Policy - Post Consultation - For Approval
11/10/2016	11.7	Vivonne Bay Beach Access Track Ongoing Maintenance
11/10/2016	11.8	Adoption of Kangaroo Island Sport, Recreation and Open Space Strategy Review 2015
11/10/2016	12.1	Asset Services & Infrastructure Status Report
11/10/2016	14.1	Senate Environment and Communications References Committee - Inquiry into oil or gas drilling in the Great Australian Bight
11/10/2016	14.2	American River Community & Sports Association lease
11/10/2016	14.3	Commissioner for KI - Economic, Social and Ecological Sustainability Indicators for Kangaroo Island
11/10/2016	15.1	Correspondence for information - various
27/10/2016	1.1	Opening by the Mayor
27/10/2016	3.1	In-Confidence Report - CEO Review
27/10/2016	3.2	In-Confidence Report - Organisational Chart
27/10/2016	3.3	In-confidence Report - Special Event
27/10/2016	3.4	In Confidence Report - Legal Matter
27/10/2016	3.5	Airport Upgrade - State Funding Agreement
08/11/2016	1.1	Opening by the Mayor
08/11/2016	5.1	Mayor's Report
08/11/2016	8.1.1	Question on Notice - Cr Liu - Quotes for Penneshaw CWMS connection works
08/11/2016	9.1	Finance Committee Minutes 31/10/16
08/11/2016	9.2	Audit Committee Minutes 31/10/16
08/11/2016	10.1	CEO Activities / Meetings report
08/11/2016	10.2	Committee Representation
08/11/2016	10.3	Deputy Mayor Appointment
08/11/2016	10.4	Airport Upgrade - State Funding Agreement
08/11/2016	10.5	FRWA Public Consultation
08/11/2016	10.6	Informal Gathering Policy Amendment
08/11/2016	11.1	Business Support Status Report
08/11/2016	11.2	Audit Committee Annual Report

08/11/2016	11.3	Finance Committee Annual Report
08/11/2016	11.4	Development & Environmental Services Status Report
08/11/2016	11.5	Proposed Land Management Agreement - Island Resort Hotel - CY Investments / Norman Sheun Architect.
08/11/2016	11.6	2015/16 Annual Financial Statements
08/11/2016	12.1	Asset Services & Infrastructure Status Report
08/11/2016	12.2	MacGillivray Flood Mitigation Options Study
08/11/2016	12.3	Triathlon Event Road Closures
08/11/2016	14.1	Ericsson Australia Pty Ltd (Ericsson) - Grant of Easement
08/11/2016	14.2	Housing development in Parndana proposal - Kangaroo Island Community Club
08/11/2016	14.3	Notice of Annual General Meeting - Australian Coastal Councils Association, 30 November 2016 - Late Report
08/11/2016	15.1	Correspondence for Information - various
08/11/2016	18.1	In-confidence Report - Special Event
08/11/2016	18.2	In Confidence Report - Legal Matter
08/11/2016	18.3	In-Confidence Report - Organisational Chart
17/11/2016	1.1	Opening by the Mayor
17/11/2016	3.1	2015/16 Annual Report
13/12/2016	1.1	Opening by the Mayor
13/12/2016	5.1	Mayor's Report
13/12/2016	8.1.1	Questions on Notice - Cr Denhom - Penneshaw CWMS
13/12/2016	8.1.2	Question on Notice - Cr Liu - Penneshaw CWMS
13/12/2016	10.1	CEO Meetings / Activities
13/12/2016	10.2	Representation Review
13/12/2016	11.1	Business Support Status Report
13/12/2016	11.2	Community Capital Infrastructure Grant Program CCIGP 2016-17
13/12/2016	11.3	2014 - 2018 Strategic Plan
13/12/2016	11.4	Development & Environmental Services Status Report
13/12/2016	11.5	LGA Correspondence - PDI Act - Council cost for the new e-planning system
13/12/2016	11.6	Development Assessment Panel - Re-Appointment
13/12/2016	11.7	FRWA Kerbside Waste Collection Policy Public Consultation
13/12/2016	12.1	Asset Services & Infrastructure Status Report
13/12/2016	12.2	American River Town Hall Lease
13/12/2016	13.1	Notice of Motion - Cr Willson - Penneshaw Museum CWMS Charge
13/12/2016	14.1	Kangaroo Island Uniting Church - Exemption from connection to Penneshaw CWMS
13/12/2016	15.1	Correspondence for Information - Various
13/12/2016	18.1	Business Arising from In-confidence Minutes of 08.11.16
17/01/2017	1.1	Opening by the Mayor
17/01/2017	5.1	Mayor's Report
17/01/2017	9.1	Awards and Grants Panel Committee Meeting - 2017 Community Partnership Grants and Citizen/Project/Event of the Year Awards
17/01/2017	9.2	Boating Facilities Meeting Minutes 17/11/2016
17/01/2017	10.1	CEO Activities / Meetings Report
17/01/2017	10.2	Renewal of Parndana Sports Club Lease
17/01/2017	10.3	Penneshaw Progress Association request to use Council Reserve for a Community Park and Sculptured Walk
17/01/2017	11.1	Business Status Report
17/01/2017	11.2	Development & Environmental Services Status Report

17/01/2017	12.1	Asset Services Status Report
17/01/2017	12.2	MG Car Club Visit October 2017
17/01/2017	12.3	Extension of School Zone
17/01/2017	13.1	Notice of Motion - Cr Denholm - Pelican Feeding at Kingscote Foreshore
17/01/2017	14.1	Correspondence from Mr Fred Willson - Penneshaw Car parking
17/01/2017	14.2	Dry Zone - 2017 KI Cup Carnival
17/01/2017	14.3	Minister Hunter - Community Consultation Report on Bickford's proposal for Kingscote Wharf
17/01/2017	14.4	SA Power Networks - Kangaroo Island Submarine Cable and RIT-D update
17/01/2017	14.5	Late Report - Penneshaw Sculpture Trail
17/01/2017	15.1	Correspondence for information - various
17/01/2017	17.1	Urgent Business - Support for speed reduction
14/02/2017	1.1	Opening by the Mayor
14/02/2017	5.1	Mayor's Report
14/02/2017	10.1	CEO Activities / Meetings
14/02/2017	10.2	Airport Upgrade Status Report
14/02/2017	10.3	Penneshaw CWMS update
14/02/2017	11.1	Business Support Status Report
14/02/2017	11.2	New Borrowings
14/02/2017	11.3	Quarterly Finance Status Report - December 2016
14/02/2017	11.4	KI Social Media Alliance (KISMA) Half-Yearly Report
14/02/2017	11.5	2017/18 Annual Budget and Long Term Financial Plan Framework
14/02/2017	11.6	Hartley LMA Associated with Land Division Application 520/D012/16 - Lot 105 DP12638 Hundred of Haines.
14/02/2017	11.7	Development & Environmental Services Status Report
14/02/2017	11.8	Penneshaw Sculptural Walk Community Consultation Feedback
14/02/2017	12.1	Asset Services Status Report
14/02/2017	12.3	By-Law Review
14/02/2017	12.4	CWMS Policy amendment for Developer contributions
14/02/2017	13.1	Cr Denhom - Pelican Feeding at Kingscote Wharf
14/02/2017	13.2	Cr Joy Willson - Trethewey Terrance Penneshaw
14/02/2017	14.1	Advance Kingscote Progress Association - Kingscote Skate Park
14/02/2017	15.1	Correspondence for Information - various
14/02/2017	17.1	Council Meeting Venue
07/03/2017	1.1	Opening by the Mayor
07/03/2017	3.1	Luzhou International Conference & Exhibition Visit
14/03/2017	1.1	Opening by the Mayor
14/03/2017	9.1	Boating Facilities Committee Minutes 16/02/2017
14/03/2017	9.2	Finance Committee Minutes - 1 March 2017
14/03/2017	10.1	CEO Meetings / Activities
14/03/2017	10.2	Airport Upgrade Status Report
14/03/2017	10.3	Bio-Energy Project
14/03/2017	10.4	Review Report 2017 IRCD for SA Ombudsman
14/03/2017	10.5	ECSA Determination: Elector Representation Review 2016/17
14/03/2017	10.6	American River Development Opportunity
14/03/2017	10.7	Penneshaw Oval Lease - Dudley Football Club
14/03/2017	11.1	Business Support Status Report
14/03/2017	11.2	Street Numbering March 2017 - Island Beach, Sapphire town, Nepean Bay
14/03/2017	11.3	Street Numbering March 2017 - Baudin Beach, Vivonne Bay
14/03/2017	11.4	Community Centres Working Group update

14/03/2017	11.5	Application form for Busking & Fundraising events
14/03/2017	11.6	Development & Environmental Services Status Report
14/03/2017	11.7	Major Development Projects & DAC Assessments - DAP review & advice.
14/03/2017	11.8	DAC Referral Response - 108 room hotel, Lot 502 CP23109, Dauncey Street Kingscote.
14/03/2017	11.9	Dog and Cat Fees Schedule 2017-18
14/03/2017	11.10	Amended Internal Review of Council Decisions
14/03/2017	11.11	Authorised Officers / Regulatory Services - Use of CCTV (Self Contained Personal Security Cameras)
14/03/2017	11.12	New Provider After hours Service - Oracle Customer Management Solutions (CMS)
14/03/2017	11.13	Boating Facilities Committee Section 41 Committee Members and Terms of Reference
14/03/2017	12.1	Asset Services Status Report
14/03/2017	14.1	American River Hall
14/03/2017	14.2	Kangaroo Island Natural Resources Management Board - Proposed increase of Levy
14/03/2017	14.3	LGA - Public Awareness Campaign on Rate Capping
14/03/2017	15.1	Correspondence for Information - Various
14/03/2017	18.1	Nominations for the Premier's Award for Outstanding Community Service
14/03/2017	18.2	Airport Upgrade Project
16/03/2017	1.1	Opening by the Mayor
16/03/2017	3.1	Code of Conduct 2017/01
11/04/2017	1.1	Opening by the Mayor
11/04/2017	5.1	Mayor's Report
11/04/2017	7.1	Petition regarding Timber Creek Bridge
11/04/2017	8.1.1	Cr Liu - Recent sewerage overflow in Penneshaw
11/04/2017	8.1.2	Cr Liu - Sealing of 2nd Runway - Airport Upgrade
11/04/2017	10.1	CEO Activities / Meetings
11/04/2017	10.2	Airport Upgrade Status Report
11/04/2017	10.3	Resilient Hills and Coasts Regional Sector Agreement
11/04/2017	11.1	Business Support Status Report
11/04/2017	11.2	Development & Environmental Services Status Report
11/04/2017	11.3	2017/18 FRWA Budget
11/04/2017	11.4	Boating Facilities Committee Terms of Reference
11/04/2017	11.5	Airport Charges & Fees
11/04/2017	11.6	Arts Officer Grant
11/04/2017	11.7	FRWA Kerbside Collection Policy Public Consultation Report
11/04/2017	11.8	State Local Government Infrastructure Partnership Program - CWMS Rising Main C
11/04/2017	11.9	Quarterly Finance Status Report - March 2017
11/04/2017	12.1	Asset Services & Infrastructure Status Report
11/04/2017	12.2	CWMS Customer Charter / Policy
11/04/2017	12.3	Electrical Indenture request
11/04/2017	13.1	Cr Denholm - Rescind Motion - NRM Levy
11/04/2017	14.1	Advance Kingscote Progress Association - Proposed Tourist Information Centre
11/04/2017	14.2	Advance Kingscote Progress Association - Beautifying Kingscote for upcoming events
11/04/2017	15.1	Correspondence for information - various

09/05/2017	1.1	Opening by the Mayor
09/05/2017	5.1	Mayor's Report
09/05/2017	8.1.1	Cr Denholm - Forestry - Airport Upgrade
09/05/2017	9.1	Boating Facility Meeting Minutes 06/04/2017
09/05/2017	9.2	Audit Committee Minutes - 20 April 2017
09/05/2017	9.3	Finance Committee Meeting 4 May 2016
09/05/2017	10.1	CEO Activities / Meetings
09/05/2017	10.2	Bennett Court American River - revocation proposal - public consultation submissions
09/05/2017	10.3	Revoke Kangaroo Island Airport (Kingscote) from its Community Land classification
09/05/2017	10.4	Airport Upgrade Status Report
09/05/2017	11.1	Business Support Status Report
09/05/2017	11.2	Community Centres Working Group Update
09/05/2017	11.3	Finance Policies Review 2017-18
09/05/2017	11.4	Street Numbering May 2017 - Baudin Beach & Vivonne Bay
09/05/2017	11.5	Draft Annual Business Plan 2017-18
09/05/2017	11.6	Long Term Financial Plan
09/05/2017	11.7	On-Island Vehicle Inspection & Driver License Service
09/05/2017	11.8	Development & Environmental Services Status Report
09/05/2017	11.9	Naming of Street in Island Beach
09/05/2017	12.1	Asset Services & Infrastructure Status Reports
09/05/2017	12.2	Parklet Installation
09/05/2017	14.1	Main South Road Action Group
09/05/2017	14.2	Boat Operators of South Australia
09/05/2017	15.1	Correspondence for information - various
09/05/2017	16.1	Notifications & Reports Request
09/05/2017	18.1	Code of Conduct 2017/01
09/05/2017	18.2	Special Event
25/05/2017	3.1	Airport Fees & Charges
25/05/2017	3.2	Queens Baton Relay
13/06/2017	8.1.1	Cr P Masters - Cruise Ships
13/06/2017	9.1	Boating Facility Meeting Minutes 18 May 2017
13/06/2017	10.1	CEO Activities / Meetings
13/06/2017	10.2	Airport Upgrade Status Report
13/06/2017	10.3	Inconfidence register - Annual review
13/06/2017	10.4	Annual Business Plan & Budget 2018/19 - Consultation dates
13/06/2017	10.5	Report on a proposal to revoke the Kangaroo Island Waste Resource Recovery Centre land, North Coast Road, Kingscote from its Community Land classification
13/06/2017	10.6	Kangaroo Island Airport Runway 1533 Seal Assessment
13/06/2017	10.7	Regional Development Australia & Kangaroo Island Council Funding Agreement
13/06/2017	10.8	Dudley United Football Club Lease Update
13/06/2017	11.1	Business Support Status Report
13/06/2017	11.1	Adoption of Annual Business Plan 2017/18
13/06/2017	11.2	Public Consultation Report - Annual Business Plan & Budget 2017/18
13/06/2017	11.3	Development & Environmental Services Status Report
13/06/2017	11.4	Periodic Policy Review June 2017
13/06/2017	11.5	Payment of Rates

13/06/2017	11.6	Declaration of Annual Service Charge - Community Wastewater Management System (CWMS) for 2017/18
13/06/2017	11.7	Schedule of Fees and Charges 2017/18
13/06/2017	11.8	Update to Schedule of 'Non-Replace' Assets
13/06/2017	11.9	Finance Policies
13/06/2017	11.11	Adoption of Annual Budget 2017/18
13/06/2017	11.12	Adoption of 2017/18 Valuations
13/06/2017	11.13	Declaration of 2017/18 Differential General Rates & Fixed Charge
13/06/2017	11.14	Declaration of Separate Rate - Regional NRM Levy 2017/18
13/06/2017	11.15	Declaration of Annual Service Charge - Waste Management 2017/18
13/06/2017	11.16	FRWA Kerbside Collection Policy
13/06/2017	11.17	Renewal of American River Community & Sports Association Lease
13/06/2017	11.18	By-Law Review
13/06/2017	11.19	Determination of the areas to which specific provisions of By-laws apply
13/06/2017	11.20	Cemetery Policy. Periodic Review with Amendments
13/06/2017	11.21	Fire Prevention Officer Policy
13/06/2017	12.1	Asset Services Status Report
13/06/2017	12.2	Camera Bay Safety Improvement
13/06/2017	12.3	Birchmore Road Bus Parking Bay
13/06/2017	12.4	Seat Installation on Kingscote Walking Trail
13/06/2017	14.1	Rebuild Independence Group - request for rent review
13/06/2017	15.1	Correspondence for Information - Various
13/06/2017	18.1	Code of Conduct Report
30/06/2017	3.1	FRWA Kerbside Waste Policy & Green Waste Collection boundaries
01/07/2017	3.2	Kingscote Skate Park
02/07/2017	3.3	Code of Conduct 2017/02
03/07/2017	3.4	Legal Advice
11/07/2017	5.1	Mayor's Report
11/07/2017	8.1.1	Cr Liu - Code of Conduct 2017/01
11/07/2017	10.1	CEO Activities / Meetings
11/07/2017	10.2	Airport Upgrade Status Report
11/07/2017	10.3	Kangaroo Island Airport (Kingscote) - Community Land revocation proposal - public consultation submissions
11/07/2017	10.4	Commissioner For Kangaroo Island Act 2014 - Council's Formal Response To The Environment, Resource & Development Committee Review Process.
11/07/2017	11.1	Business Support Status Report
11/07/2017	11.2	Community Capital Infrastructure Grant Program - Annual Review
11/07/2017	11.3	Boat Launching & Vehicular Beach Access under Foreshores & Boating Facilities By-law No. 8 (2017) - For Public Consultation
11/07/2017	11.4	Declaration of Dog 'On Leash', 'Off Leash' and 'Dogs Prohibited' areas under Dogs By-law No. 5 (2017) - For Public Consultation
11/07/2017	11.5	Christmas Cove Marina Safety Signage
11/07/2017	11.6	Authorisation & Permit - Kangaroo Island Promotion Developments Pty Ltd
11/07/2017	11.7	Development & Environmental Services Department - Status Report
11/07/2017	11.8	Finance Quarterly Report - July 2017
11/07/2017	11.9	Legislated Policy Review
11/07/2017	11.10	Amendment to Cemetery Policy
11/07/2017	11.11	Late Report - Penneshaw Penguin Centre lease renewal
11/07/2017	12.1	Asset Services Status Report
11/07/2017	15.1	Correspondence for information - various

11/07/2017	18.1	Awards & Grants Committee Minutes - 4 July 2017
08/08/2017	1.1	Opening by the Mayor
08/08/2017	5.1	Mayor's Report
08/08/2017	9.1	Boating Facilities Meeting Minutes 20 July 2017
08/08/2017	10.1	CEO Activities / Meetings
08/08/2017	10.2	Airport Upgrade Project update
08/08/2017	10.3	Penneshaw CWMS - Additional Connections
08/08/2017	10.4	CEO Performance Review consultant
08/08/2017	10.5	Kangaroo Island Waste Resource Recovery Centre - Community Land revocation proposal
08/08/2017	11.1	Business Support Status Report
08/08/2017	11.2	Development & Environmental Services Status Report
08/08/2017	11.3	Re-appointment of Council (Development) Assessment Panel - Pursuant to PDI Act 2016.
08/08/2017	11.4	Community Centres Working Group Update
08/08/2017	11.5	Street Numbering - Kingscote Review
08/08/2017	11.6	Late Report: Rates & Rebates Policy minor amendment.
08/08/2017	12.1	Asset Services Status Report
08/08/2017	14.1	Wattle Range Council - Capping of Government Fees & Charges
08/08/2017	15.1	Correspondence for information - various
08/08/2017	18.1	Airport Upgrade Project - Item 18.2 - 14 March 2017 Council Meeting
12/09/2017	1.1	Opening by the Mayor
12/09/2017	5.1	Mayor's Report
12/09/2017	10.1	CEO Activities / Meetings
12/09/2017	10.2	Airport Upgrade Status Report
12/09/2017	10.3	Audit Committee - Appointment of Chairperson
12/09/2017	10.4	Penneshaw CWMS update
12/09/2017	10.5	Penneshaw CWMS Extension areas
12/09/2017	11.1	Kangaroo Island CWMS Septic Tank Pump-out Scheme
12/09/2017	11.1	Business Support Status Report
12/09/2017	11.2	Cygnets River Tennis Courts
12/09/2017	11.3	International Small Islands Studies Association 2017 Conference
12/09/2017	11.4	Fund My Neighbourhood Grant Program
12/09/2017	11.5	Development & Environmental Services Status Report
12/09/2017	11.6	Street Name Review - Seaview Road, Kingscote
12/09/2017	11.7	Dogs By-Law 5 - Determination of On Leash / Off Leash and Dogs Prohibited Areas.
12/09/2017	11.8	Authorisation & Permit - Parndana Progress Association
12/09/2017	11.9	Foreshore & Boat Facilities By-law 8 - Determination of Beach Boat Launching and Vehicle Access Areas
12/09/2017	11.11	Amended Informal Gathering Policy
12/09/2017	11.12	Late Report: Amended: Code of Practice - Access to Council Meetings and Committee Meetings and Documents
12/09/2017	11.13	Late Report: Meeting Procedures Code of Practice
12/09/2017	12.1	Asset Services Status Report
12/09/2017	12.2	Modification to Penneshaw Parking
12/09/2017	12.3	Adoption of Infrastructure Guidelines SA
12/09/2017	14.1	Reeves Point Road Upgrade
12/09/2017	14.2	Correspondence for Discussion - Local Government Finance Authority (LGFA) Annual General Meeting

12/09/2017	15.1	Correspondence for Information - various
10/10/2017	1.1	Opening by the Mayor
10/10/2017	5.1	Mayor's Report
10/10/2017	8.1.1	Cr Liu - Kangaroo Island Airport Upgrade
10/10/2017	8.1.2	Cr Liu - CEO Performance Review
10/10/2017	9.1	Boating Facilities Committee Meeting
10/10/2017	10.1	CEO Activities / Meetings
10/10/2017	10.2	Airport Upgrade Status Report
10/10/2017	10.3	CEO Delegations 2017-2018
10/10/2017	11.1	Business Support Status Report
10/10/2017	11.2	Work Health & Safety and Injury Management Policy & Procedure
10/10/2017	11.3	Lyn Walsh - Substitute Land Management Agreement - Lot 2 DP 44208 Graham Road, Seal Bay.
10/10/2017	11.4	Development & Environmental Services Status Report
10/10/2017	12.1	Asset Services Status Report
10/10/2017	12.2	Tin Smith Road
10/10/2017	15.1	Correspondence for information - various
14/11/2017	1.1	Opening by the Mayor
14/11/2017	5.1	Mayor's Report
14/11/2017	8.1.1	Cr Denholm - Kingscote CWMS & KI Airport Upgrade
14/11/2017	8.1.2	Cr Denholm - Kingscote Sewerage Ponds
14/11/2017	9.1	Finance Committee Meeting 06/11/2017
14/11/2017	9.2	Audit Committee Minutes 06/11/2017
14/11/2017	10.1	CEO Activities / Meetings
14/11/2017	10.2	Airport Upgrade Status Report
14/11/2017	10.3	Committee Representation
14/11/2017	10.4	Deputy Mayor Appointment
14/11/2017	10.5	Allotment 248 HD of Haines - Nepean Bay Community Land rededication
14/11/2017	10.6	Proposals to revoke Community Land classification of parcels of land
14/11/2017	10.7	Penneshaw CWMS extension area - West
14/11/2017	10.8	Late Report - Prospect Hill
14/11/2017	11.1	Business Support Status Report
14/11/2017	11.2	Community Centres Working Group update
14/11/2017	11.3	Development & Environmental Services Status Report
14/11/2017	11.4	Lyn Walsh - Substitute Land Management Agreement - Lot 2 DP 44208 Graham Road, Seal Bay.
14/11/2017	11.5	Dauncey Hotel Development 520/E005/16 - Car Parking & Car Parking Fund Contribution Determination.
14/11/2017	11.6	Sealink Terminal Development 520/083/11 - Car Parking Area - Foam Bitumen Seal - Compliance with Conditions of Consent
14/11/2017	11.7	Council Grant Policy Review 2017
14/11/2017	11.8	KI Commissioner - KI Visual Arts Action Plan
14/11/2017	11.9	2016-17 Annual Report
15/11/2017	11.10	2016/17 Annual Financial Statements
14/11/2017	11.11	2016/17 Finance Committee Annual Report
14/11/2017	11.12	2016/17 Audit Committee Annual Report
14/11/2017	11.13	Quarterly Finance Status Report - September 2017
14/11/2017		
14/11/2017	11.14	Duck Lagoon Land Lease

14/11/2017	11.15	Late Item: Bin allocation for schools within the FRWA Kerbside Waste Collection Policy
14/11/2017	12.1	Asset Services Status Report
14/11/2017	14.1	Letter from Member for Finniss Mr Michael Pengilly MP
14/11/2017	14.2	SA Health - Nomination of a member of the Kangaroo Island Health Advisory Council Inc.
14/11/2017	14.3	Late Report - Election of South Australian Representatives to Australian Coastal Councils Association Committee of Management
14/11/2017	15.1	Correspondence for Information - various
14/11/2017	18.1	Recruitment of the Independent Chairperson for the FRWA Board
12/12/2017	1.1	Opening by the Mayor
12/12/2017	5.1	Mayor's Report
12/12/2017	9.1	Boating Facilities Committee Meeting
12/12/2017	10.1	CEO Activities / Meetings
12/12/2017	10.2	Airport Upgrade Status Report
12/12/2017	10.3	Proposals to revoke Community Land classification of parcels of land
12/12/2017	10.4	Representation Amendments to the S41 Boating Facilities Committee TOR and Council Committee Membership Charter
12/12/2017	11.1	Business Support Status Report
12/12/2017	11.1	Building Better Regions Fund - Penneshaw Sculpture Trail
12/12/2017	11.2	Development & Environmental Services Status Report
12/12/2017	11.3	DRAFT Kangaroo Island Animal Management Plan - For Public Consultation
12/12/2017	11.4	Outdoor Dining Policy Review
12/12/2017	11.5	Special Local Roads Programme
12/12/2017	11.6	Mobile Food Vendors Policy Review 2017.
12/12/2017	11.7	Triathlon "Sufferfest" Event Report
12/12/2017	11.8	Community Capital Infrastructure Grant Fund 2017-18
12/12/2017	11.9	Community Centres Working Group Update
12/12/2017	12.1	Asset Services Status Report
12/12/2017	12.2	Fees & Charges Review
12/12/2017	12.3	Additions to the Road Network Extension Policy
12/12/2017	12.4	Change to Timber Creek & Rowland Hill Hwy intersection - Give way / Right of way protocol
12/12/2017	12.5	Naming of new streets at Emu Bay
12/12/2017	12.6	Naming of an Unnamed Road
12/12/2017	12.7	Idea for Muston Road Upgrade
12/12/2017	12.8	Mulberry Tree Condition Update
12/12/2017	12.9	Stokes Bay Public Amenities - Capital Works Update
12/12/2017	14.1	Ombudsmans Final Report - Whether the Council's disclosure of the identity of a whistleblower in the public minutes of a meeting was contrary to law
12/12/2017	15.1	Correspondence for Information - various
12/12/2017	18.1	Forestry Roads - Item Deferred
16/01/2018	1.1	Opening by the Mayor
16/01/2018	5.1	Mayor's Report
16/01/2018	8.1.1	Cr Liu - Council Christmas Show
16/01/2018	8.1.2	Cr Liu - Staffing matters in relation to the former Deputy CEO
16/01/2018	8.1.3	Cr Liu - Emu Bay Boat Ramp Upgrade
16/01/2018	8.1.4	Cr Liu - Emu Bay Boat Ramp Upgrade
16/01/2018	9.1	Awards & Grants Assessment Panel
16/01/2018	10.1	CEO Activities / Meetings report

16/01/2018	10.2	Airport Upgrade Status report
16/01/2018	10.3	Kangaroo Island Waste Resource Recovery Centre Land, North Coast Road, Kingscote - Community Land Revocation
16/01/2018	10.4	Kangaroo Island Airport - Community Land Revocation
16/01/2018	11.1	Business Support Status Report
16/01/2018	11.2	Quarterly Finance Status Report - December 2017
16/01/2018	11.3	Development & Environmental Services Department - Status Report
16/01/2018	11.4	Street Name Review - Seaview Road Kingscote
16/01/2018	11.5	Draft Council Lands Data Sheet - New Insertion
16/01/2018	11.6	Consent for Deposit of Plan - Regards Transfer of Land Management Agreement - L.L. Bruce - Sections 2001 & 2004 HP110800, Hundred of menzies.
16/01/2018	12.1	Asset Services Status Report
16/01/2018	14.1	Transfer of One Card Agreement to the Libraries Board of South Australia
16/01/2018	14.2	Dry Zone - 2018 KI Cup Carnival
16/01/2018	15.1	Correspondence for information - various
13/02/2018	1.1	Opening by the Mayor
13/02/2018	5.1	Mayor's Report
13/02/2018	8.1.1	Cr Liu - Staffing matters in relation to the former Deputy CEO
13/02/2018	8.1.2	Cr Liu - CEO Expenses & Payment for Additional Days Worked
13/02/2018	10.1	CEO Meetings/ Activities
13/02/2018	10.2	Airport Upgrade Status Report
13/02/2018	10.3	CEO Expenses Report
13/02/2018	10.4	Biomass Energy Project
13/02/2018	11.1	Business Support Status report
13/02/2018	11.2	Events on Kangaroo Island - 20 February 2018
13/02/2018	11.3	Development & Environmental Services Status Report
13/02/2018	11.4	Kangaroo Island Council Animal Management Plan - Post Public Consultation - For Approval.
13/02/2018	11.5	2018/19 Annual Budget and Long Term Financial Plan Framework
13/02/2018	11.6	New Borrowings
13/02/2018	11.7	Council Lands Data Sheet - Proposed New Insertion. Conclusion of Community Consultation.
13/02/2018	11.8	Social Media Policy Review 2017/18
13/02/2018	12.1	Naming of Unnamed Road
13/02/2018	12.2	Asset Services & Infrastructure Status Report
13/02/2018	12.3	Additional Supplementary Local Roads Funding
13/02/2018	12.4	K I Motor Club Time Trial
13/02/2018	12.5	Animal carcass disposal fee review
13/02/2018	12.6	Additions to the Road Network Extension Policy
13/02/2018	13.1	Cr Denholm - Fire Risk
13/02/2018	14.1	Late Item - Bicycle SA Annual Tour to Kangaroo Island
13/02/2018	14.2	Late Item - Potential sale of Section 507 Hundred of Dudley and Allotment 1 in Deposited Plan 76540 Pelican Lagoon
13/02/2018	14.3	Late Item - Life Time Private Retreats - request for mulch
13/02/2018	15.1	Correspondence for information - various
13/02/2018	18.1	Report for Information - CEO Contract
13/03/2018	5.1	Mayor's Report
13/03/2018	8.1.1	Cr Liu - CEO Expenses & Payment for Additional Days Worked

13/03/2018	8.1.2	Cr Liu - CEO's Briefing Paper on overtime claims - Item 10.3 of February 2018 agenda
13/03/2018	9.1	Boating Facilities Committee Minutes 15 February 2018
13/03/2018	9.2	Finance Committee Meeting 1 March 2018
13/03/2018	10.1	CEO Activities / Meetings
13/03/2018	10.2	Airport Upgrade Project Status Report
13/03/2018	11.1	Airport Fees & Charges
13/03/2018	11.2	Business Support Status Report
13/03/2018	11.3	Community Centres Working Group Notes 15 February 2018
13/03/2018	11.4	Development and Environmental Services Department Status Reports
13/03/2018	11.5	Update on Council Employees Code of Conduct Policy & Procedure
13/03/2018	12.1	Asset Services & Infrastructure Status report
13/03/2018	13.1	Cr Denholm - CEO TOIL (Time Off in Lieu) Payments.
13/03/2018	14.1	Correspondence for discussion - Proposal to purchase partial Council road reserve
13/03/2018	15.1	Correspondence for information - various
15/03/2018	3.1	Code of Conduct against CEO
10/04/2018	1.1	Opening by Mayor
10/04/2018	5.1	Mayor's Report
10/04/2018	5.2	Risk Management - CEO
10/04/2018	5.3	mayors report
10/04/2018	8.1.1	Cr Liu - Council's resolution - Minute: C73:2018
10/04/2018	8.1.2	Cr Liu - KI Airport Upgrade Project
10/04/2018	8.1.3	Cr Denholm - Camping on Crown Lands
10/04/2018	8.1.4	Cr Liu - Elected Members Register of Allowances & Benefits
10/04/2018	8.1.5	Cr Denholm - Annual Business Plan & KI Airport Upgrade Project
10/04/2018	8.1.6	Mayor Clements - Christmas Cove
10/04/2018	8.1.7	Cr Liu - Ombudsman's Final Report
10/04/2018	10.1	CEO Meetings / Activities
10/04/2018	10.2	Airport Upgrade Status Report
10/04/2018	10.3	2018 Election Progress Report
10/04/2018	10.4	Finance Department Quarterly Report
10/04/2018	10.6	Kangaroo Island Airport Upgrade Project - Budget Update
10/04/2018	10.7	Art and Cultural Facilitator Proposal
10/04/2018	10.8	CEO report
10/04/2018	10.9	CEO report
10/04/2018	11.1	Business Support Status Report
10/04/2018	11.2	SIRPA Toilet Amenity Request - Island Beach
10/04/2018	11.3	FRWA Waste Policy
10/04/2018	11.4	FRWA Annual Business Plan & Budget
10/04/2018	11.5	Renewal of Airport Land Lease
10/04/2018	11.6	Development & Environmental Services Status Report
10/04/2018	11.7	Proposals to revoke Community Land classification of parcels of land - public consultation submissions
10/04/2018	11.8	Newly Legislated Code of Conduct for Council Employees
10/04/2018	11.9	Total Cost of FOI Requests
10/04/2018	12.1	Asset Services Status Report
10/04/2018	13.1	Cr Liu - Overtime payments claimed by the CEO
10/04/2018	13.2	Cr Denholm - KI Airport Upgrade Project
10/04/2018	13.3	Cr Liu - Airport Operating Budget

10/04/2018	14.1	Ombudsman's final report for whether the Council undertook its review of Mr Ayliffe's complaint in accordance with its Code of Conduct for Elected Members Procedure.
10/04/2018	15.1	Correspondence for information - various
26/04/2018	3.1	Deputy CEO recruitment
08/05/2018	1.1	Opening by Mayor
08/05/2018	5.1	Mayor's Report
08/05/2018	8.1.1	Mayor Clements - Christmas Cove
08/05/2018	8.1.2	Cr Liu - Airport Upgrade Project
08/05/2018	8.1.3	Cr Liu - Council Christmas Party
08/05/2018	9.1	Audit Committee Meeting Minutes 16 April 2018
08/05/2018	9.2	Boating Facilities Committee Meeting 19 April 2018
08/05/2018	10.1	CEO Activities Report
08/05/2018	10.2	Airport Upgrade Report
08/05/2018	10.3	Resignation from Cr Cathie Tydeman
08/05/2018	10.4	Committee representation due to resignation
08/05/2018	10.5	Distribution of Employee Costs
08/05/2018	11.1	Business Support Status Report
08/05/2018	11.2	Development & Environmental Services Status Report
08/05/2018	11.3	Draft Annual Business Plan 2018-2019
08/05/2018	11.4	Beach Access & Boat Launching Designation - Review - Strawbridge Point Access & Boat Launching
08/05/2018	11.5	Periodic Policy Review
08/05/2018	11.6	Finance Policy Review
08/05/2018	11.7	Community Centres Working Group update - 19 April 2018
08/05/2018	11.8	Emu Bay Pop-Up Cafe Community Consultation
08/05/2018	11.10	Late report - S&HLGA Budget & Membership subscriptions 2018-2019
08/05/2018	12.1	Asset Services Status Report
08/05/2018	12.2	Infrastructure Asset Management Plans - Buildings & Structures; Reserve Furniture
08/05/2018	15.1	Correspondence for information - various
12/06/2018	1.1	Opening by the Mayor
12/06/2018	5.1	Mayor's Report
12/06/2018	8.1.1	Mayor Clements - Christmas Cove
12/06/2018	9.1	Boating Facilities Committee Meeting 17 May 2018
12/06/2018	9.2	Finance Committee Meeting 7 May 2018
12/06/2018	10.1	CEO Activities
12/06/2018	10.2	Airport Upgrade Report
12/06/2018	10.3	Inconfidence register - Annual review 2018
12/06/2018	10.4	CEO Performance Review - Consultant appointment
12/06/2018	11.1	Declaration of Separate Rate - Regional NRM Levy 2018/19
12/06/2018	11.2	Development & Environmental Services Status Report
12/06/2018	11.3	FRWA DRAFT Business Plan 2017-2020
12/06/2018	11.4	Community Centres Working Group update - 17 May 2018
12/06/2018	11.5	Public Consultation Report - Annual Business Plan & Budget 2018/19
12/06/2018	11.6	Adoption of Annual Business Plan 2018/19
12/06/2018	11.7	Adoption of Annual Budget 2018/19
12/06/2018	11.8	Adoption of 2018/19 Valuations
12/06/2018	11.9	Declaration of 2018/19 Differential General Rates & Fixed Charge
12/06/2018	11.1	Business Support Status Report

12/06/2018	11.11	Declaration of Annual Service Charge - Waste Management 2018/19
12/06/2018	11.12	Declaration of Annual Service Charge - Community Wastewater Management System (CWMS) for 2018/19
12/06/2018	11.13	Payment of Rates
12/06/2018	11.14	Schedule of Fees and Charges 2018/19
12/06/2018	11.15	Finance Policies
12/06/2018	11.16	Use of Kangaroo Island Council Seal for Grant Variation
12/06/2018	11.17	Update - Ombudsman's recommendations for handling of a Code of Conduct Complaint.
12/06/2018	11.18	Scheduled Policy Review - Shipping Containers Policy
12/06/2018	11.19	Scheduled Policy Review - Building Inspection Policy
	11.2	Mandatory Election Policies and Guiding Documents
12/06/2018	11.21	Emu Bay Pop-up Cafe Community Consultation Results
12/06/2018	11.22	Street Numbering Review Kingscote
12/06/2018	11.23	Kangaroo Island Social Media Alliance
12/06/2018	11.24	Country Arts SA Application for Arts Officer Partnership Grant
12/06/2018	12.1	Asset Services Status Report
12/06/2018	13.1	Cr Denholm - Increase to CCIGP for 2018/19
12/06/2018	13.2	Cr Denholm - Street Seating at Nat Thomas St Penneshaw
12/06/2018	14.1	Friends of Parks KI Western Districts - 100th anniversary of the gazetting of Flinders Chase National Park
12/06/2018	14.2	Ombudsman's final report - Investigation of complaint about Cr Joy Willson
12/06/2018	15.1	Correspondence for Information - various
12/06/2018	18.1	Final Report on Code of Conduct complaint against CEO
12/06/2018	18.2	Debt Management - Section 181-184 Of The Local Government Act 1999
12/06/2018	18.3	Insurance Claim against Council
12/06/2018	18.4	Outstanding Rates
12/06/2018	18.5	Forestry Update
10/07/2018	5.1	Mayor's report
10/07/2018	8.1.1	Cr Liu - Emu Bay Boat Ramp Upgrade
10/07/2018	8.1.2	Cr Liu - Closure of Council Office
10/07/2018	9.1	Awards and Grants Panel Meeting - 09/07/18
10/07/2018	10.1	CEO Activities / Meetings
10/07/2018	10.2	Airport Upgrade Project Status Report
10/07/2018	10.3	FRWA - Green Waste initiative
10/07/2018	11.1	Business Support Status Report
10/07/2018	11.2	Development and Environmental Services Status Report
10/07/2018	11.3	Strawbridge Point Beach Access & Boat Launching
10/07/2018	11.4	Hardship Policy (ESCOSA) Periodic Review
10/07/2018	11.5	Permit Parking at Boating Facilities
10/07/2018	11.6	Stokes Bay (Rockpool) Cafe Lease
10/07/2018	11.7	Community Capital Infrastructure Grant Program
10/07/2018	11.8	Southern Ocean Lodge Airport Lounge Lease
10/07/2018	11.9	Christmas Cove Marina Berth Leases
43291.00	11.10	Finance Quarterly Report
10/07/2018	11.12	Parndana Progress Association Funding Request
10/07/2018	11.13	Closure of the Principal Office of Council to support Airport Opening arrangements.
10/07/2018	11.14	Digital Advertising Fees at the Kangaroo Island Airport
10/07/2018	12.1	Asset Services Status Report

10/07/2018	12.2	Intersection Safety Options
10/07/2018	12.3	Naming of Un-named road reserves
10/07/2018	14.1	Minister for transport, Infrastructure & Local Government - Rate Capping
10/07/2018	14.2	South Australian Oyster Growers Association - request for fee relief
10/07/2018	14.3	Variety V2 Motorcycle Run - October 2018
10/07/2018	14.4	Outback Air race 2018 - request for fee waiver
10/07/2018	15.1	Correspondence for information - various
12/09/2018	5.1	Mayor's Report
13/09/2018	8.1.1	Cr Liu - Project Management of Emu Bay Boat Ramp Upgrade
14/09/2018	8.1.2	Cr Liu - Wave Attenuation Boards for Emu Bay Boat Ramp Upgrade Project
15/09/2018	8.1.3	Cr Liu - Emu Bay Boat Ramp Upgrade Project
16/09/2018	10.1	CEO Activities / Meetings
17/09/2018	10.2	Airport Upgrade Status Report
18/09/2018	10.3	Penneshaw Structure Plan - draft
19/09/2018	10.4	Old American River Health Service building - expression of interest for a tourism proposal.
20/09/2018	10.5	Request for Support - Parndana Land Development
22/09/2018	11.1	Business Support Status Report
24/09/2018	11.2	Development & Environmental Services Status Report
25/09/2018	11.3	Head Delegation to CEO. Local Nuisance & Litter Control Act
26/09/2018	11.4	Council Assessment Panel - Re-Appointment of Panel
27/09/2018	11.5	Sale of land for unpaid Council rates
28/09/2018	11.6	Funding Request - Parndana Bowling Club
29/09/2018	11.7	Tourist Accommodation Development in Coastal Conservation Zone - Crown Solicitors determination & impact on Development / Economic Prospects
30/09/2018	11.8	Township Boundary adjustments
01/10/2018	11.9	Update of Disposal of Assets Policy
21/09/2018	11.10	Support Policies for the Induction of New Council.
23/09/2018	11.11	ESCOSA Consultation Paper - South Australian Local Government rate oversight scheme
02/10/2018	12.1	Asset Services Status Report
03/10/2018	14.1	Election of Local Government Association President 2018-2020
04/10/2018	15.1	Correspondence for Information - Various
05/10/2018	18.1	Development / Change of Land Use Issue
06/10/2018	18.2	Annual CEO Performance Review
09/10/2018	1.1	Opening by the Mayor
09/10/2018	5.1	Mayor's Report
09/10/2018	5.2	Key Performance Indicators for CEO for 2018/19
09/10/2018	8.1.1	Cr Denholm - Nepean Bay Township
09/10/2018	8.1.2	Cr Liu - Emu Bay Boat Ramp Upgrade Project
09/10/2018	9.1	Boating Facilities Committee Meeting 20 September 2018
09/10/2018	10.1	CEO Meetings / Activities
09/10/2018	11.1	Business Support Status Report
09/10/2018	11.2	Boating Facilities Committee - replacement of member
09/10/2018	11.3	Community Centres Working Group - 20 September 2018
09/10/2018	11.4	Development & Environmental Services - Status Report
09/10/2018	11.5	Quarterly Finance Status Report
09/10/2018	11.6	Sale of Land for non-payment of rates
09/10/2018	11.7	Elected Member Computer System Usage Policy
09/10/2018	11.8	Risk Management Policy

09/10/2018	12.1	Asset Services Status Report
09/10/2018	13.1	Cr Ricketts - taping all Council meetings
09/10/2018	14.1	Correspondence for Discussion - Local Government Finance Authority (LGFA) Annual General Meeting
09/10/2018	15.1	Correspondence for information - various
09/10/2018	15.2	Airport Upgrade Project Update
09/10/2018	18.1	Elections for the positions of representative members of the Board of Trustees - LGFA
22/11/2018	5.1	Outgoing Mayor's Report
22/11/2018	8.1.1	Cr Liu - Emu Bay Boat Ramp Upgrade
22/11/2018	9.1	Finance Committee Meeting Minutes 30 October 2018
22/11/2018	9.2	Audit Committee Meeting Minutes 30 October 2018
22/11/2018	9.3	Special Audit Committee Meeting Minutes 9 November 2018
22/11/2018	10.1	CEO Activities / Meetings
22/11/2018	10.2	Deputy Mayor Appointment
22/11/2018	10.3	Ordinary Council Meeting Times
22/11/2018	10.4	Items Laid on the Table
22/11/2018	10.5	Section 41 Committee - Audit Committee
22/11/2018	10.6	Section 41 Committee - Finance Committee
22/11/2018	10.7	Section 41 Committee - Boating Facilities Committee
22/11/2018	10.8	Fleurieu Regional Waste Authority (FRWA) (Regional Subsidiary) Appointment of Member
22/11/2018	10.9	Section 41 Committee - Awards and Grants Assessment Committee
22/11/2018	10.10	CEO Performance Management Panel
22/11/2018	10.11	Other Committees and Workgroups Membership
22/11/2018	10.12	Council Assessment Panel - Appointment of Elected Member
22/11/2018	10.13	Southern and Hills Local Government Association (S&HLGA) - regional subsidiary Member appointment
22/11/2018	10.14	Closure of the Principal Office of Council for Christmas Period
22/11/2018	10.15	Aviation Security - Submission to Commonwealth
22/11/2018	10.16	MOU between KI Council and KIPT
22/11/2018	10.17	Airport Upgrade Final Report
22/11/2018	11.1	Business Support Status Report
22/11/2018	11.2	Development & Environmental Services Status Report
22/11/2018	11.3	2017/18 Annual Financial Statements
22/11/2018	11.4	2017-18 Annual Report
22/11/2018	11.5	Audit Committee Annual Report
22/11/2018	11.6	Finance Committee Annual Report
22/11/2018	11.7	Elected Members Allowances and Benefits Policy & Schedule
22/11/2018	11.8	Fees & Charges Review
22/11/2018	12.1	Asset Services Status Report
22/11/2018	13.1	Cr Liu - Emu Bay Boat Ramp Upgrade
22/11/2018	14.1	Australian Tourism Councils Advocacy Group
22/11/2018	15.1	Correspondence for information - various
09/10/2018	18.2	Airline Servicing